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Leighton Contractors (Asia) Limited

Introduction of the Organisation
Established in 1975, this year marks Leighton Asia’s 
50th Anniversary in Hong Kong. Leighton Asia has 
been at the forefront of high-profile infrastructure 
projects throughout Asia. As a member of CIMIC 
Group, a family of industry leaders proven across 
diverse disciplines, sectors and environments. We 
operate in Hong Kong and six other regions in Asia. 

Over these five decades, our landmark projects in 
Hong Kong, ranging from rail and road infrastructure 
to boundary control facilities and healthcare facilities, 
have driven Hong Kong’s economic and social 
development.

Leighton Asia has a dedicated Information Systems 
and Digital department, under which there are various 
discipline streams which focus on different aspects of 
digitalisation. First, the Digital stream includes Digital 
Construction, which focuses on the development 
of Digital Engineering expertise such as Building 
Information Modelling (BIM), along with the use of 
innovative digital technology and it’s integration into 

our core services. For the Information Systems stream, 
this includes traditional IT services, along with the 
development and integration of digital systems and 
platforms into the business.

Importantly, these organisational streams are also 
reflected in our project organisation plans to ensure 
consistency across our projects.


